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In 1873 blacksmith Ludwig Lüling and
pub owner Wilhelm Pilling founded 
W. Pilling & Co. The metalworking craft
enterprise started its successful story by
supplying the local wire industry with an-
nealing pots, water wheels and similar
products.
In more than 135 years the smith's shop
developed into a world-wide operating in-
dustrial enterprise employing today more
than 120 people, being able to 
supply our worldwide customers with Pil-
ling products.
In 2000 a new production site W. Pilling
Riepe & Co. KG was built in the north of
Germany. This was required for develo-
ping new markets and due to the lack of
space in the existing plant in Altena.
You can find PILLING products in more
than a hundred countries in the world.
The worldwide sales are coordinated
from the Altena office.

In our Riepe plant we make Pilling kettles
and other special weld constructions for
the galvanizing industry. With our experi-
ence of more than hundred years and
continuous improvement of both, materi-
als and production technologies, we are in
a position to produce galvanizing kettles
in all dimensions and shapes for all kinds
of heating systems.

Upon request we can coordinate the ne-
cessary kettle design details with your fur-
nace supplier. We also assist you in
selecting most favourable and punctual
transport and if desired we can provide 
our renowned Pilling Service.
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